
Dr. D.V. Joshi was born on 1st October, 1961 in the Mehsana   district  Gujarat. He 
obtained his B.V.Sc & A.H. and M.V.Sc  degrees from College of Veterinary Science and 
Animal Husbandry, Anand in the year 1985 and 1989, respectively. He did his Ph.D. in 
Veterinary Pathology in 1996 from the College of Veterinary Sciences, G.B. Pant 
University of Agriculture and Technology, Pantnagar. He started his career as junior 
lecturer in Livestock Inspector Training Centre, Sardarkrushinagar in September, 1985 
and rose to Professor & Head, Department of Veterinary Pathology, College of Veterinary 
Science and Animal Husbandry, S.K. Nagar, Gujarat. 

Dr. Joshi has rich experience of 30 years in teaching and research. He has so far 
published 73 research papers in national and international journals of repute. He has 
presented more than 110 research papers including 6 lead papers in 45 
seminars/symposia and 9 training programmes /summer schools. He has been recipient 
of 14 awards which includes IAVP-Young Scientist Award-1996; IVJ-Dr. K.S. Nair 
Memorial Prize-1998; IAVP-Varsha Award-2000; IAVP-Best Poster Awards 2001, 2002 & 
2011; Dr. J.P. Trivedi Award-2003; University Best Teacher Award, 2006-2007; IAVP 
President Appreciation Award-2009 for outstanding performance as Zonal Secretary, 
West Zone. His three M.V.Sc students also received Chancellor's Gold Medal for Best Post 
Graduate research work. 

Dr. Joshi has so far guided 25 M.V.Sc and 1 Ph.D. student. Dr. Joshi has isolated canine 
parvovirus from the diarrheic dogs in India for the first time. He has worked mainly on 
canine parvo viral diarrhea, neonatal calf diarrhea, etiopathology of lamb mortality and 
toxicopathology of various heavy metals and newer pesticides in rats.  He has established 
a modern diagnostic pathology laboratory and a pathology museum in his department. 
Dr. Joshi is life member of several scientific bodies and member of editorial board of three 
journals of international repute. He has acted as external examiner/paper setter/thesis 
evaluator of different SAU's in India. 

Dr. Joshi has organized three Gujarat State Chapter IAVP Meets and one West Zone 
IAVP Meet. He has successfully organized five refresher courses on “Laboratory 
Techniques for Animal Disease Diagnosis” for the Veterinary Officers of the Govt. of 
Gujarat.  As a Chairman of Student Representative Council, Dr. Joshi has organized a 
number of extracurricular activities and various sports events in SDAU. He is very 
popular amongst the student community.

 The Association confers Fellowship and the title of Fellow of Indian 
Association of Veterinary Pathologists (FIAVP) on Dr. D.V. Joshi   for his outstanding 
contributions to the advancement of  Veterinary Pathology in India.
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